ANNEX B

LBP Insurance Brokerage, Inc.
Procurement Monitoring Report
As of December 31, 2022
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'COMPLETED PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES
NP-53.9 - Small -
1 g:m‘?c‘;‘k"f)”s““'m“ Bt NO | Vaiue N/A | 09/08 | N/A | 09/13 | 00/13 | 09/13 | 09/13 | 09/13 | 09/13 | 10120 | 10/20 | N/A | N/A C“g°""°(c"°oa"’)‘"‘° 600,000.00 | 600,000.00 -| 476,000.00 | 476,000.00 I NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
Procurement
Monthly checking and quarterly P53.9 - Smel Corporate O
2 |general cleaning for the Preventive | 5 NO |Value N/A | 06/03 | N/A | 06/08 | 06/08 | 06/08 | 06/08 | 06/08 | 06/08 | 06/22 | 07/06 | N/A | N/A te Operating | 700.000.00 | 700,000.00 -| 696,000.00 | 696,000.00 - NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
Maintenance of VRF Air Procurement Budget (COB)
Conditioning System
NP-53.9 - Small
5 |QMS-SO Surveillance Audit usl | No |velue NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | 12028 | 12128 C“W"m?&‘m";"‘g 50,000.00 | 50,0000 -| 5000000  50,000.00 N | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | A
Procurement of Timekeeping, NP-53.9 - Small Corporate Operating
6 |Payroll, and Human Resource uB | No |Vele NA | 05/12 | NA | 0125 | 05125 | 06125 | 06125 | 06/02 | 06/03 | 0614 | 06/15 | 11/15 | 11/18 | COForEE BREEING | 1,000,000.00 | 1,000,000.00 .| o9t6.888.88 -| 91688888 | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
Information System (HRIS) e vl
NP-53.9 - Small
7 l;_’:;‘"‘"""“""“"“"" ue | No |veue 05/06 | 05/11 | NIA | N/A | 05/20 | 06724 | 06124 | 06/24 | 06724 | 07/04 | 07104 | NIA | N/A c?”“'?(‘;’s';) 150,000.00 | 150,000.00 -| 128,000.00 | 128,000.00 N 7 S S S 7 N
Procurement udge
g |Upgrade and Renewal of G-Suite |75 | o (Ot NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | 0920 | 0020 | 09120 | 00720 | 09r20 | oar2 | COrPorate Operating |y 5ng 400 0 | 1,500,000.00 - 1,263,696.00 | 1,263,696.00 S NA | NA | NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA
Business Plan (Email System) Contracting Budget (COB)
NP-53.9 - Small
o [RenewalofLicense of Microsoft |10 o/l No | Valus NA | 1018 | NA | NA | 1026 | 10728 | 10128 | 1102 | 11102 | 11/02 | 1102 | 11104 | 11i04 | COPOTEe Opotalng | 700,000,00 |  700,000.00 -| 50374800 | 50374800 S NA | Na | nA | A | NA | NA | A
Offce 365 e udget (COB)
11 |Renewal of License of Web Hosting |IT Personnel | N0 |27¢t NA | NIA | NA | NA | N/A | 08115 | 0845 | 00/01 | 09/01 | 09/01 | 09/01 | 09/05 | 09/05 u’?“‘ﬁ?&;‘"‘g 90,000.00 | 90,000.00 -| 5600000  56000.00 S| NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
NP-53.9 - Small it
13 [Procurement of ten (10) units of uBl | NO |vake NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | 0207 | 0207 | 02007 | 02007 | o207 | COBorete Cperaling | 600,000.00 .| 60000000 | 589,800.00 .| 58980000 | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
laptop Procurement udget (COB)
2 n NP-53.9 - Small i
14 |Regular Seminar/Trainings for uet | No |Velwe NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | N | N | CoTporate Gporaling | 4 000.00.00 | 1,000,000.00 -l sat31e11| 53131911 Na | A | NA [ A | A | NA | N
Employees Procurement udget (COB)
Annual Subscription/Maintenance N Corporate Operating
16 |for Virtual Machine for Remote | IT Personnel | No | 0¥ect NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA [ 12028 | 12128 | 1228 | NA | NA 600,000.00 | 600,000.00 -| 38000000 380,000.00 N[ N[ NA | A | A | NA | N
Contracting Budget (COB)
Access / Cloud Virtualization
NP-53.9 - Small
17 |Extension/Plug-ins for the Website |iT Persomel| NO | Valus 0511 | 05112 | N/A | 05720 | 05/20 | 05720 | 05/20 | 06/14 | 06/14 | 06/22 | 06/27 | 06/30 | NIA °°B°°‘°”“()$)‘"‘“ 50,000.00 |  50,000.00 .| 2650000 2650000 S ona |l oNa [ Na | A | A | NA | A
Procurement
Antigen/RT-PCR Testing for NP-53.9 - Small
19 |Confirmed/Exposed LIBI uel | No |Vewe NA | NA | WA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | N | WA | A | Corporate Operating |y cnq 60000 | 1,500,000.00 -| 40319200| 40319200 ona [ Na [ A | A | A | NA | N
posed
{Employoes__ e o Budget (COB)
21 [ServerMainenarcs w | w0 [Oee NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | 1200 | 12100 | 12109 | 12220 | NA | NA Cﬁ“‘?gg.’?)“"“ 200,000.00 | 200,000.00 -| 15200600 152,096.00 A | A | A | NA | A | NA | N
4 " NP-53.9 - Small
2 |Replacement of Firewall Device ™ Value 05106 | 05/12 | NA | 05720 | 05120 | 05720 | 05720 | 0602 | 08102 | 0B/27 | 0628 | NA | NA | COTPO "’?gga‘)‘““ 500,000.00 -| 50000000 | 380,000.00 - 280,00000 | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
Procurement
|iiBs Change/Enhancement o Corporate Operating
quests and Mai s | wo |Oreet NA | NA | NA | NA (104 | 1200 | NA | 1209 | 1209 | NA | NA | NA | Na | COBORE BRSBING | 1,500,000.00 -| 1,500,00000 | 940,800.00 | 940,800.00 Sonaf oA | A | A | A | NA | N
Support
Corporate Giveawsys ™ Gomveive | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA C"'g°"‘°°[c”°os‘)"'° 1,500,000.00 | 1,500,000.00 - | 1,277,000.00 | 1,277,000.00 Al Al NA | A [ NA | NA | N
. q NP-53.9 - Small
26  |Directors’ and Officers' Liabllity usl | No |Vale NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | A | a | Cororate Operating |y 446 006 09 | 1,000,000.00 - | 1,556,250.00 | 1,556,250.00 S na A | NA | A | NA | NA | NA
Insurance (DOLI) Budget (COB)
NP-535 i
27 |Renovation of Office u | N0 NA | NA | NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | Na | NA | A | A | NA %Bw*“?gg.';;m 11,600,000.00 - [11,600,000.00 | 1,754,838.30 | 175483830 | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
NP-53.9 - Small -
32 |Additonal Intemet Service Provider | Usi | N0 |vae NA | 0831 | NA | N/A | 09/08 | 09/20 | 09/20 | 09120 | 09720 | 0920 | 0920 | NIA | NA C“BW;;?gg;;’"ﬂ 450,000.00 | 450,000.00 -| 40320000 40320000 Sl Na | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
rocurement
3 w(gs%wnwmm v | oNo (Dt NA | NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | 09005 | 00/05 | 0905 | 0905 | N | NA | COTOTae Bperaing | g6,000,00 | 960,000.00 -1 809,088.00 | 809,088.00 S na A | wa | A | NA | NA | A
Private Automatic Branch el Corporate Operating R
P e v | N0 |vake NA | NA | NA | NA [ NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | COBomE RO 660,000.00 660,000.00 | 614,123.76 61412376 | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
Actuarial Services for the valuation pEORL0 - Sonall Corporate Operating R
Actuscel Servioes ver | o e NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA [ NA | NA 1229 | NA [ 1220 | N | A | SO RO 5000000 |  50,000.00 4900000 | 49,000.00 I N N S S 7S 7 Y
Additional CCTV Camera and NEO3) = Simall Corporate Operating
1 ERY ) - 000, 800, = 800,
ER froesighpiidmicid, uel | N |Veus NA | NA | NA | NA [ 1020 | NA | NA |18 | 1128 | N | 11728 | 1220 | 1220 | OB RO 150,000.00 150,000.00 | 121,800.00 121,80000 | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA
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NP-53.9 - Small
40 |Multi-Function Printers vl | No |Vee NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA [ 1228 | NA [12128 | A | N te Op 40,000.00 -| 4000000 2419000 24,190.00 e | na | A [ A | A | A | A
- Budget (COB)
TOTAL ALLOTED BUDGET OF PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES 27,150,000.00
TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE OF PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES CONDUCTED 14,103,530.05
TOTAL SAVINGS (TOTAL ALLOTED BUDGET - TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE) 13,046,469.95
FAILED BIDDING PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES
NP-53.9 - Small
3 |Replacement of Compressor usl | No |velue NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA mcw 1,000,000.00 - | 1,000,000.00 - . S ona | A | Na | A | A | NA | N Did not materialized
NP-53.9 - Small
4 E'““‘“"‘”"“"M (2) Units usl | No |vee NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA mm 150,000.00 | 150,000.00 - - S NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | A | FalledBd- Nonavaiabilly of
B | oo and risir 0t e N0 [P | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA “?““'mm‘“ 300,000.00 | 300,000.00 - - - <l NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA Did not materialized
Personal Protective Equipments NP-53.9 - Small Corporate Operating
PR = ust | No |veke NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | COBomE RO 200,000.00 | 200,000.00 - - - Sl na | A NA | A | NA | NA | NA Did not materialized
15 |Strategic/Cdrporate Planning sl vo v ™ L A | NA [ nA | NA [ NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | N | wa | Corporate Operating |00 o0 60 | 50000000 . B . | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA Did not materialized
Procurement Budget (COB) T T
NP-53.9 - Small
1 |mplementation of Health & Safety | gy | No [vake NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | A | CoPorate Operaling | gp 00000 | 50,000.00 - . - S Nna A [ NA | A | NA | NA | NA Did not materialized
orkplace Procurement udget (COB)
2 :'P'B' | R"I"')‘"m"’c""“”""cy s | no |Comvetive NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | Copome ‘()gs'a‘)""“ 1,500,000.00 | 1,500,000.00 ) - - oNa [ A | A | Na | NA | A | A Did not materialized
NP-53.9 - Small
24 |Installation of UPS sl NO | Value NA | NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NIA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA °°'g°"“"(°g5';)"°9 50,000.00 |  50,000.00 - : - -| NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | Failed Bid - No Bid Received
15
28 |PurchaseofOffice Fumitures and | gy | o |Comettve | A | A [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA °°'§°"! te Oporatind | 3,000,000.00 - | 3,000,000.00 - i < NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA Did not materialized
- 5 NP-53 - Smal
29 |Atemate two (2 Unitsof Back-Up | 5 | o | Voo NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA [ NA | A | wa | Corporate Operating | gqg 06 oo | 800,000.00 - - </ na | A | na | wa | NA | NA | NA | Faled Bid - No Bid Received
Server Procurement Budget (COB)
NP-53.9 - Small
30 |Back-up storages usl | N |Volus NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | Na | Coomte 500,000.00 -| 500,000.00 . . </ Na | A | A | wA | NA | NA | NA | Failed Bid - No Bid Received
Procurement udget (COB)
3o e oo SYSeM | ue | o (o | NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | A | Copome Ogg;"’“’) 500,000.00 -] 500,000.00 i : | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | Failed Bid- No Bid Received
34 |Integration of CHATBOT to IIBS w | w0 B NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA me 1,000,000.00 - | 1,000,000.00 - i S| Na [ A | A | A | NA | NA | NA | Failed Bid - No Bid Received
NP-53.9 - Small
38 |Sound System usl NO | Value NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA cm?gg)““ﬂ 60,000.00 -|  80,000.00 - : -/ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | Failed Bid - No Bid Received
NP-53.9 - Small
Heavy Duty Cross-Cut Paper usl | No |vee NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA [ NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | A | NA mw 10,000.00 -] 10,000.00 - ) | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | NA | Faled Bid-Bid Offer aboved ABC
TOTAL ALOTTED BUDGET OF FAILED BIDDING PROCUREMENT ACTIVITIES 9,420,000.00
PREPARED BY: RECOMMENDING APPROVAL:
RE . CAN| : R. VILLAFUERTE
BAC &ecretariat BAC, Ch | General \ HoPE JfPresident & CEO
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LBP (Land Bank of the Phil.) INSURANCE BROKERAGE, INC.

1982 - 2022

POSTING CERTIFICATION

This is to certify that the LBP (Land Bank of the Phil.) Insurance
Brokerage, Inc. (LIBI) has posted its Procurement Monitoring Report for the
2" Semester for FY 2022 on its agency website, and can be accessible
through this link:

https://Ibp-insurance.com/images/pdf/2022-procurement-monitoring-report-2n
dsem.pdf

This certification is being issued in compliance with GPPB Circular No.
02-2020, this 14" of January, 2023.

RENALYN P. CANEJA

Head, Bids and Awards Committee Secretariat

12 Floor SyCip Law Center

105 Paseo de Roxas, Legaspi Village, Makati City
Trunklines: 8812-4911 | 8867-1063 | 8893-5638 CERTIFIED
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